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1. GENERAL (cont'd) 

 
In addition and subject to the appropriate regulatory approvals, the Company may grandfather or 
discontinue all services governed by this Tariff in certain geographic areas.  Once grandfathered, such 
services will no longer be available for purchase and existing customers will no longer be able to 
move, add or change their existing service.(1) 

 For service availability by Wire Center: https://cpr.att.com/common/DLS_Filing_Info.htm 
      or service availability by address: https://cpr.att.com:8443/search/csiServiceAvailability 

 

 
Grandparented services will be made available within 90 days upon Carriers service order. 
Grandparented services may be resold by Carrier to those eligible to subscribe to such service from 
the Company for the remaining period of eligibility.  Grandparented services may be transferred to 
Carriers as long as the Carrier’s customer is eligible for the grandparented service, and the 
grandparented service has not been abandoned, pursuant to statutory procedure.  A grandparented 
service shall be available for resale under this Part 22 as soon as possible but no later than ninety 
(90) days after Carrier’s service order.  In the meantime, such service may be resold at retail rates 
by Carrier, and any usage information associated with the service will be supplied on a monthly 
rather than daily basis.  When the grandparented service becomes available for resale under this 
Part, the Company will conduct a true up and adjust Carrier’s account with any difference in the 
retail charges paid by Carrier and the Part 22 rates applicable to the grandparented service.  The 
Part 22 grandparented rates will be at the same discount percentage as the group of services of 
which the grandparented service is a part. 
 
Pursuant to the Telecommunications Act of 1996, these services are also available subject to 
negotiation to telecommunications carriers, as defined by the Act, and may be obtained from the 
Company pursuant to contract.  This will make these services available to such carriers at a range 
of rates. 
 
The Company will provide Resale Local Exchange Services in Wisconsin subject to the availability 
of facilities, where technically feasible and from properly equipped central offices, unless availability 
is limited per provisions outlined in the AT&T Wisconsin Guidebook, Part 2, Section 2, paragraph 
21 (TDM to IP Transition). 
 
The application of business or residence service is determined in accordance with general 
regulations in P.S.C. of W. 20, Part 4, Section 2 based upon the appropriate classification of the 
Carrier’s Customer’s (also referred to as “end user”) service.  Local exchange service cannot be 
utilized as a substitute for carrier access services.  The Company reserves the right to commission 
an independent audit to ensure that these conditions have been met. 
 
Resale of flat rate local exchange services or any other local exchange service does not entitle the 
Carrier to receive access charge revenue associated with either originating or terminating 
transmission of interexchange services over such resold service (s). 
 
Note 1:  Effective on or after December 31, 2023 (as permitted by the FCC), neither new nor existing 
customers will be permitted to purchase services in certain geographic areas.   
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